Constantino, Mike

From: John Kniery [JKniery@foleyandassociates.com]
Sent: Monday, January 28, 2013 11:58 AM

To: Constantino, Mike

Subject: FW: 12-083 Obligation

Attachments: SCFA13011711370.pdf

Mike: |s there a response process for the obligation that was submitted for the above referenced project? Thanks for
your consideration on this matter.

John P. Kniery

Health Care Consultant

Foley & Associates, Inc.

1638 So. MacArthwr Boulevard
Springtield, 1llinois 62704
217.544.1551 - Office
217.544.3615 - Facsimile
foley@foleyandassociates.com

iknierv@foleyandassociates.com

CONFIDENTIALITY NOTICE

This transmission and the attachments accompanying it contain confidential information belonging to the sender that is legally
privileged. The information is intended cnly for the use of the individual or entity named above. The authorized recipient of this
information is prohibited from disclosing this information to any other party and is required to destroy the information after its stated
need has been fulliled unless otherwise required by law. If you have received this transmission in error, please notify the sender
immediately and destroy all copies of this message including any attachments. If you are not the intended recipient, you are hereby
notified that any disclosure, copying, distribution or publication of this message, or the taking of any action based on it is strictly
prohibited. The sender hereby reserves all legal rights it has in this message and all rights to take action to protect it or obtain damages
for unauthorized disclosure copying, distribution, publication or use.

From: John Kniery

Sent: Thursday, January 17, 2013 11:47 AM

To: 'Constantino, Mike'

Cc: 'Christopher 1. Lukaart'; Ed Grogg; blevinson@platinumhc.net
Subject: 12-083 Obligation

Mike: Please accept the attached as documentation providing proof of obligating the project. If there is anything else
that you need, please do not hesitate to contact me. in addition, you will notice that obligation actually occurred under
the previous project 08-086, therefore, this correspondence is to meet the letter of the law. Many thanks for your
consideration on this matter.

John P. Kniery

Health Care Consultant

Foley & Associales, Inc.

1638 So. MacArthur Boulevard
Springfield. lllinois 62704
2175441557 - Office




217.544 3615 - Facsimile
foley@foleyandassociates.com

jkniery@foleyandassociates.com

CONFIDENTIALITY NOTICE

This transmission and the attachiments accompanying it contain confidential information belonging to the sender that is legally
privileged. The information is intended onty for the use of the individual or entity named above. The authorized recipient of this
information is prohibited from disclosing this information to any other party and is required to destroy the information after its stated
need has been fulfilled unless otherwise required by law. If you have received this transmission in error, please notify the sender
immediately and destroy all copies of this message including any attachments. If you are not the intended recipient, you are hereby
notified that any disclosure, copying, distribution or publication of this message, or the taking of any action based on it is strictly
prohibited. The sender hereby reserves ali legal rights it has in this message and all rights to take action to protect it or obtain damages
for unauthorized disclosure copying, distribution, publication or use.
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3089 Old Jacksonville Rd.
Springfield, IL
HAND DELIVERED
January 17 , 2013

Ms. Courtney Avery, Administrator

Hlinois Health Facilities and Services Review Board
Illinois Department of Public Health

525 West Jefferson Street, Second Floor

Springfield, llinois 62761
Re:  12-083, Springfield Nursing and
Rehabilitation Center ~ Obligation
Dear Ms. Avery: |

Please accept this letter as verified notification that the above referenced project was
obligated on September 30, 2011 under Project No. 08-086, a copy of which is attached (refer to
EXHIBIT I). Please refer to the enclosed the MS Springfield, L.P. (formerly known as MS
Springfield, LLC) loan statement from Springfield’s Town and Country Bank as documentation
of the financing, which you will note is almost completed at this time (EXHIBIT II). In fact,
this Project is scheduled for completion on or prior to February 1, 2013. The project’s cost,
scope and design are in compliance with that which has been approved as part of the Permit
Approval for Project No. 12-083.

Obligation, according to Section 1130.140, “Obligation" means the commitment of at
least 33% of total funds assigned to cover total project cost, that occurs by: 1) The actual
expenditure of 33% or more of the total project cost; and/or 2) The commitment to expend 33%
or more of the total project cost by signed contracts or other legal means. The loan statement is
indicative of item number 2 of the definition as the Applicants have already spent over 33% of
the total project cost. '

I trust that the above information and documentation formally addresses the project’s
obligation of this project and clears up any and all question and concerns presented by staff. If
you have any further questions or concerns with this matter, please do not hesitate to contact me.
Thanks You.

Sin

BridryLevinson




ENCLOSURES
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MY Coumanc: STATE OF ILLNOIS

ON EXPIRES 7.28-2015

John P. Kniery — CON Consultant
Michael Constantino — HFSRB Staff

V. Edward Grogg — MS Springfield, L.P.

State of lllinois

County of otz
S\iv)om to before me this
| ‘)_’b.dayof “Xen thcy ,2,0@*
2013

Notary Publi
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AIA Document A162"‘-—2007

Standard Form of Agreement Between Owner and Contractor whers the basis of
payment Is the Gost of the Work FPlus a Fee with @ Guaranteed Maximum Price

AGREEMENT made as of the 30th day of September In the year 2011

(In words, Indicate day, month and year.)
BETWEEN the Owner:

(Name, legal status, oddress and other information) '

Mainstrest Properties Group, Ino,
109 West Jackson Strest
Closro, IN 46034

. -and the Contmactor;

—

(Name, legul siatus, addrass and other information)

Walsh Construstion Company II, LLC

| 929 West Adams Strest

‘Chigago, 1L 60607

for the following Project:
(Name, Tocation and detatled description)

Speingfield Short Stay Rehab Facility

. 3089 Old Jacksonvills Road

Sptingfield, XL 62704

‘The Architeot: :
Narne, Tegal status, address and ather informatio

MSETD of Hiinots, Ino.

1715 Magoavox Way
Fort Wayne, IN 46804

The Owner and Contractor agree as follows,

ADDITIONS AND RELETIONS:
The euthor of this document has
added information needed for its
oomplefien, The author may eso
have revised the taxt of the onginal
AlA atandard fonm. An Adoltfons end
Delatlons Report that notes added
information as wel as revislons to the
standard torm taxt ie avallable from
the author and should be reviewsd. A
wertioal line in the left margin of this
document Indicates where the euthor
has added necesssary mformation
and where the awthor hae added to of
dajatad from the original AIA text,

Thia docyment has important legal
conaexuences. Consultalion wih an
attorney Is ancouragad with respect
to Its completion or medifiaation.

This document Is not Intended for
use Ih competitive bldding.

AlA Dastumeni A201™M-2007,
General Conditians of te Contract
for Construclion, is adopted in this
decument by referance. Do hot uae
with other general condltions untess
this document is modifiad.

AIA Cocumant A162™ 2007 (formierly A111™ - 1867). Copyright @ 1920, 1926, 1961, 1958, 1681, 1889, 1387, 1674, 1678, 1987, 1987 and 2007 by Tha
American inatiiule of Archilects, A ghis reserved, WARNING: Thie AlA® Document Is protsetes by U.S. Capyright Lew and International Treatlea.
Unaathorfzed reproduction or tlistribution of thia AIA® Document, or any portion of i, muy result In savera olvl) and criminal penaities, and will be
proastuted fo ths maximum extent possiblo under tha faw. Tha dooiment wes produced by AlA software al 13:44:22 on 00/30/2041 undar Order

KoARB8204841_t which expires on 08/4/2012, and (s nut for rasale, -

Usor Notes:

(913047076)




tnit.

This Agreement entered into as of the day and year first written above,

T

UAGTOR W) <
| /A%Wé;% b 18 Conseucion Comgany 1, LC

{Printed name and title) (Prirted name and title)

AIA Dooumant A10Z™ - 2007 (formarly A414™-1907). Copyright © 1920, {925, 1951, 1056, 1881, 1803, 1087, 1874, {878, 1067, 1607 end 2007 by The
American Isilile of Archilocis, AR rights raaarved, WARNING: This AIA® Docuiment Is protectsd by U.B, Copyright Law ang Intornetionat Treaties.
Unauthorized rapraduction of distrtbution ofthis AIA® Daoument, or any partion of it, may result is severe avll and otiminal ponaltlas, and wili bie
prosecuter to the maximum extent pessibla under the law. This dooument was produced by AIA saflvrare at 13:44:22 on 08/38/2011 under Order

No.426020404 §_1 which oxplres on 08/14/2012, and (s nat for resale,
UserNotes: (819007076}
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. - MAILING ADDRESS
Town and Penples N . P.O. Box 13265
Countryi Bank Prosperity i Bank Springfield, IL 62791
" SidebySide OVt of oo s Canty bk SiclebySide
debySi

ACCOUNT NUMBER a
PAYMENT DUE DATE

PAYMENT AMOUNT

MS Springfield, LILC

¢/0 Kylee Turner McMurray
109 W Jackson Street

POB 767

Cicero IN 46034 500 L-;'D ayce

PLEASE RETURN TOP PORTION OF STATEMENT WITH YOUR PAYMENT (MADE PAYABLE TO: TOWN AND COUNTRY BANK)

STATEMENT DATE - 1/03/13

.00

TOTAL CURRENT DUE ”
TOTAL AMDUNT YOU ARE PAYING

PAGE 1

ACCOUNT NUMBER M PAYMENT DUE DATE
CURRENT BALANCE 9,836,062.01 PRINCIPAL DUE
INTEREST RATE YD INTEREST DUE
INTEREST PAID YTD .00 ESCROW/OTHER CHGS
MATURITY DATE ST TOTAL, CURRENT DUE
CREDIT LIMIT : 10,360,000.00 PAST DUE AMOUNT .00
LATE CHARGES DUE .00
AVALLABLE CREDIT 523,937.99 TOTAL AMOUNT DUE S
. AUOUNT. BALANCE
BEGINNING BALANCE ' 8,627,011.47
12/13/12 PRINCIPAL ADVANCE 1,209,050.54 9,836,062.01

12/13/12  INTEREST OMNLY PAYMENT 37,302.04 9,836,062.01

MAILING ADDRESS
P.0. Box 13255
Springfield, IL 82791

If you have questions In ragard to your account, please call 217.782.3100 or Toll-Free 888.770.3100.
Vislt qur websita at www.townandeountrybank.com or call our 24-hour autometed service Anytime Line: 800.505.56124




LOWN and ge
country s
financial 1, corp.

Tuly 6, 2011

Mr. Clint Mitchell

Managing Direotor

LCG Capital Group, LLC

450 Basl 96™ Street, Suite 500
- Indianapolis, IN 46240

Via e-mail: ciitchell@logeapital.com

RE:  MS Springfield, LLC -
3089 0ld Jacksonville Road
Springfield, Tlinois
Dear Mr. Mitchell:
Town & Country Bank io pleased to provide this commitment letter for a loan package In the total amount
of $10,360,000 for the purpose of constructmg and providing mint-perth financing for a p:oposed 45,000
square foot, 73-bed, skilled rursing facility in Springfield, llinols. This Commitment will expire on

October 6, 201 1: The financing package will be subject to and made in accordance with the terms and
conditions of this leiter (the “Cormmitment), . .

-Our Financing Connﬁixment is as follows:

Construction Loan: ’
Borrower; . MS Springfield, LLC, or some entity created to own the subject real estate.
Loan Amount; . Up to $10,360,000.00 -
Purpose! - To plovxde construction financing for ah approxzmately 45,000 8 lqua.te foot 75
bed nursing fecility at 3089-Qfd Jacksonville Road Sprmgﬁeld Tilinois. '
Term; ’ N ' Up to twenty-fout (24) month construction phase wiih monthly payments of
accrued Interest from an interest reserve ﬂOOOlmt.
© Interest Rate; Float.mg menthly at Wall Sireet Joumal Prlme Rate, plu‘ nubject toan
SR _ mtcrestrateﬂooro
TOWN & COUNTRY BANK
To Froa: 666-770-9100
www.iownsandoountrybiank.com
RO, Box 18255 PO. Box 917 107 E. Highland Dave 1646 Siafo Hwy. 121
8pringlield, It 42701-8266 Buffulo, It 62618 Foraylh, (L 82530 . ML Zion, 1L 42649
2177873100 217a64u4408 | 2178721828 217-884-2911
LOGAN COUNTY BANK 'rbmn & COUNTRY BANC MORYGAGE SERVICED, ING.
RO, Box 160 RO, Box 13856 -
Lincoin, IL. 62668 Spiingfeld, IL 62761-2255

£17-732:3161 . 212-787-8100

asroag e sy o e
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- ————— 14y

My. Clint Mitohell
LCG Cepiial Group, LLC
MS Springfield, LLC

. Commitmetit Letter

July 7, 2011
Page 6 of 6

Thank you for the opportunlty to prowde you with this commitrent for ﬁmneing H‘you are in agreement
‘with the terms and conditions outlined within this Coromitment Letter, please have an authorized
representative of the company sign the Acoeptance belaw, and return one copy of this letter with their
check in the amount of $1(J 360.00 which will be held as 8 deposit and applied io closing costs,

" ACCEPTANCE

The Borrower hereby agrees tothe above tertns and condmons and accapts this Commitment for
Fmancmg prowded by Town and Country Bank. .

ngnature of Authorized Reprwantatlve of ‘ Date
MS Springfield, LLC - . : ,




